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Your diploma says it, your student loans prove it: You went to college. But be honest: What you really
learned had nothing to do with your GPA.

Just when you thought it was safe to matriculate, three university grads reveal amazing campus stories of
hilarious extracurricular adventures and eccentricities. Ben Applebaum, Ryan McNally, and Derrick
Pittman–Web hosts of CollegeStories.com–culled through thousands of tall but true tales of psycho
roommates, legendary pranks, hellish hookups, and vertigo nights. The result is this wild collection of the
funniest and most bizarre memories from the not-so-hallowed halls of academia.

Canty’s Obituary Revenge: After his practical-joker buddies place an obituary notice in the local paper, a
baffled student returns from a weekend away to a shocked campus and hundreds of condolences.

House of the Sinking Feeling: For five Texas undergrads, a class project goes terribly awry, thanks to a
combustible mix of rabid armadillos, sporadic gunfire, a sinkhole, and cockroaches the size of cell phones.

Indoor Winter Beach Party: In what “seemed like a good idea at the time,” snow-weary roommates throw a
beach bash in their apartment, replete with swimsuits, kiddie pools, and eight hundred pounds of sand.

Hooters and Honors: A young coed/waitress at Hooters earns big tips during a fifty-two-year-old patron’s
birthday celebration–only to discover later that the “birthday boy” is her new English professor.

Uproarious and irresistibly candid, Class Dismissed should be required reading for students, grads, and only
the bravest of parents.
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From reader reviews:

Rodney Bryant:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Sure, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or read a book titled Class Dismissed: 75 Outrageous, Mind-
Expanding College Exploits (and Lessons That Won't Be on the Final)? Maybe it is being best activity for
you. You realize beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do
you agree with their opinion or you have other opinion?

Jean Gaitan:

The book Class Dismissed: 75 Outrageous, Mind-Expanding College Exploits (and Lessons That Won't Be
on the Final) make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable a lot more increase.
Book can being your best friend when you getting strain or having big problem together with your subject. If
you can make reading through a book Class Dismissed: 75 Outrageous, Mind-Expanding College Exploits
(and Lessons That Won't Be on the Final) being your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like
add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about many or all subjects. You may know
everything if you like wide open and read a e-book Class Dismissed: 75 Outrageous, Mind-Expanding
College Exploits (and Lessons That Won't Be on the Final). Kinds of book are several. It means that, science
reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Shaun Sae:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what the one you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy person? If you
don't have spare time to try and do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have spare
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They must answer that question due to
the fact just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
correct. Because start from on kindergarten until university need that Class Dismissed: 75 Outrageous,
Mind-Expanding College Exploits (and Lessons That Won't Be on the Final) to read.

Mary Moore:

In this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability in doing something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you must do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of many
books in the top collection in your reading list is Class Dismissed: 75 Outrageous, Mind-Expanding College
Exploits (and Lessons That Won't Be on the Final). This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides
can get you closer in growing to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this guide you can get
many advantages.
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